



Sales Quote

INDUSTRIAL BUSINESS INTL CORP

1580 Sawgrass Corporate Parkway
Suite 130, Sunrise, FL 33323
Tel: 954-302-3187, 315-4781
Fax: 954-838-7746
E-mail: ibicorp@intech-ie.com
Tax Certificate No. 16-8012998465-1

Quote #

IBI-2025-0069

Date:

May 06th, 2025

Customer ID

PETROMONAGAS

Bill To:

PETROMONAGAS

RIF: J-29556223-3

Urb. La Campiña. Edif. Petroleos de Venezuela Piso
7 Calle El Empalme
Telf: 0281-2807236
Attn: Juan Mardelli
Correo: mardellijs@petromonagas.pdvsa.com

Ship To:

Material will be sent to customer's warehouse at
Caracas - Venezuela.

Your #	Our #	Sales Rep	Incoterms - DDP	SHIP VIA	Terms	Validity
SOLPED 6600003963	IBI-2025-0069	S. Mendez	CCS, VEN	Pick up	See below	60 days

Item	Qty	SAP	Description	Unit Pr (US\$)	Total (US\$)
1	3	97718	ADVANCED FIELD CALIBRATOR AND COMMUNICATOR MODEL MC6, BEAMEX PN 9270000-9270560 Including: temperature, electrical and reference junction functions. FF and PF hardware capability is included Thermocouple type K and RTD type Pt100@385 calibrated as standard. (7116120) 8 hrs training is included Internal Pressure Measuring Modules for MC6 PB 9270100 PB x 2 Barometric module for MC6, 700 to 1200 mbar (10,5 to 17,4 psia) 9270160 P400mC x 2 Pressure measurement module -400 to 400 mbar g 9270240 P20C x 2 Pressure measurement module 0 to 20 bar g 9270280 P100 x 2 Pressure measurement module 0 to 100 bar g External Pressure Module 9220312 EXT10mD x 1 External pressure measurement module -10 to 10 mbar differential 9220360 EXXT250 x 1 External pressure module 0 to 250 bar g, incl. EXT cable 8066770 x 1 Accredited calibration certificates for MC6, P400mc, P20C, P100, EXT10mD and EXT250 included Options for MC6 9270500 MC6HART x 2 HART communication option 9270810 DL x 2 Multichannel Data Logger 9270700 TBC x 2 Temperature block communication option, FB/MB (MC6) 9270850 x2 Wireless communication 8081900 CC x 2 Carry case (soft)	\$566,913.00	\$1,700,739.00

		8081910 AC x 2 Accesory case (soft) 8120750 x 2 CAKIT16 sensor adapter (Pt sensor to MC6 R2) 9400300 FB660 x 1 field temperature block, 50 to 660 °C, Incl. 5620320 x 1 -Multi-hole (4mm, 6mm, 8mm, 10mm, 1/4") 9400475 x 1 -Transport case for FB series. Accredited calibration certificate is included as standard. 9010050 PGC x 2 - Pressure/vacuum pump kit - range: -0.95 to 35 bar g (-13.7 to 510 psi) - including carrying case, 40 bar pressure T-hose set and connector kit: G 1/8" male, 60° int. cone / G 1/8" male + O-ring G 1/8" male, 60° int. cone / G 1/4" B female + 2 seals G 1/8" male, 60° int. cone / G 1/4" NPT male 8003120 x 2 set of spare parts 9010260 x 2 PGHH complete kit, incl. carrying case and accesories Range: PGHH 0 to 700 bar g 8003190 x 2 - PGHH Pump kit 9010095 x1 - PGL calibration pump -400 to 400 mbar(-160 to 160 iwc, complete kit 8009550 x 3 - Pressure tubing T-kit 40 bar / 600 psi 7113300 x 9 - 1/8 BSP male with 60° int. Cone to 1/4" NPT 7113260 x 9 - 1/8"BSP male with 60°int. Cone to 1/8" NPT 8003370 x 30 - Hydrotech T-hose kit for high pressure modules,consisting of: -Adapters: 1 x 1/4" NPT and 1 x 1/8" BSP -EXT → Hydrotech Rated for 400 bar (5800 psi) at +80°C 8009440 x 2 - 1/8" ID urethane T-hose set 10mD (1.5 m) 8009095 x 6 - Pressure fitting Bx G1/8" female to 1/16" ID hose 8066830 x 6 - Connector set for barewire applications, 4 pieces 8036830 x 6 - Thermocouple plug set, incl. R/S,E,J,K,N,T-types 8066800 x 6 - Test Leads 8066810 x 6 - Test Clips 7108580 x 6 - Male connector 1/8" NPT 7108600 x 6 - Hydrotech adapter for PM (1/8" BSP→ Hydrotech) 8003505 x 3 - Swagelok connector set NPT/male 1/4 SWK – 1/8 NPT (male) 1/4 SWK – 3/8 NPT (male) 1/4 SWK – 1/4 NPT (male) 1/4 SWK – 1/2 NPT (male) teflon tape 8003520 x 3 - Swagelok connector set BSP/male 1/4 SWK – 1/8 BSP (male) 1/4 SWK – 3/8 BSP (male) 1/4 SWK – 1/4 BSP (male) 1/4 SWK – 1/2 BSP (male) set of seals 8003510 x 3 - Swagelok connector set NPT/female 1/4 SWK – 1/8 BSP (female) 1/4 SWK – 3/8 BSP (female) 1/4 SWK – 1/4 BSP (female) 1/4 SWK – 1/2 BSP (female) Teflon tape 8003530 x 3 - Swagelok connector set BSP/female 1/4 SWK – 1/8 BSP (female) 1/4 SWK – 3/8 BSP (female) 1/4 SWK – 1/4 BSP (female) 1/4 SWK – 1/2 BSP (female) set of seals SOFTWARE RANGE 9050120 x 1 CMX PRO - CMX Professional Calibration Software, one license, for		
--	--	---	--	--



			10000 positions. 9050226 - 8 hr training by local representative is included in price SOFTWARE OPTIONS 9050250 x 1 - Report Design Module and 9050365 x 1 - Configurable user interface 9050230 x 1 - History Trend Module 9050350 x 1 - Software Service Agreement for 12 months (per license)		
2	7	686721	TRUE-RMS DATA LOGGING MULTIMETER WITH TREND CAPTURE MODEL 287, FLUKE PN FLUKE287 <u>MODELO FLUKE 187 DESCONTINUADO Y REEMPLAZADO POR EL MODELO 287</u>	\$2,052.00	\$14,364.00
3	4	1001101	INFRARED THERMOMETER MODEL 62 MAX, FLUKE PN FLUKE62MAX <u>MODELO FLUKE 62 DESCONTINUADO Y REEMPLAZADO POR EL MODELO 62 MAX</u>	\$445.00	\$1,780.00
4	1	1109729	INDUSTRIAL SCOPEMETER HANDHELD OSCILLOSCOPE WITH BUS HEALTH TEST 40MHZ AND SCC KIT MODEL 125B/NA/S, FLUKE PN FLUKE 125B/NA/S	\$10,796.00	\$10,796.00
5	8	633998	TRUE-RMS CLAMP METER MODEL 376 FC, FLUKE PN FLUKE376FC <u>MODELO FLUKE 376 DESCONTINUADO Y REEMPLAZADO POR EL MODELO 376 FC</u>	\$1,670.00	\$13,360.00
6	7	569958	TOOL BAG MODEL C550, FLUKE PN 1547919	\$519.00	\$3,633.00
7	1	1048364	HYDRAULIC TEST PUMP KIT MODEL 700HTPK, FLUKE PN FLUKE 700HTPK	\$7,125.00	\$7,125.00
8	4	337466	NO BID	-	-
9	1	791634	THERMAL IMAGER CAMERA IR MODEL TI401-PRO, FLUKE PN FLUKETI401-PRO <u>MODELO FLUKE TI55 DESCONTINUADO Y REEMPLAZADO POR EL MODELO TI401-PRO</u>	\$34,790.00	\$34,790.00
10	1	496944	ELECTRONIC DIGITAL VERNIER 8" RANGE, MITUTOYO PN 500-197-30	\$605.00	\$605.00
11	1	602102	QUICKCOLLECT SENSOR KIT MODEL CMDT391-K-SL, SKF PN CMDT391-K-SL <u>MODELO SKF CMVP 50 DESCONTINUADO Y REEMPLAZADO POR EL MODELO SKF CMDT391-K-SL</u>	\$6,615.00	\$6,615.00
12	1	1031680	NO BID	-	-
13	2	796888	EARTH GROUND LOOP AND LEAKAGE CLAMP MODEL 1630-2FC, FLUKE PN FLUKE1630-2FC	\$6,417.00	\$12,834.00



			<u>MODELO FLUKE 1630 DESCONTINUADO Y REEMPLAZADO POR EL MODELO 1630-2FC</u>		
14	2	721362	INSULATION RESISTANCE TESTER MODEL 1550C, FLUKE PN FLUKE1550C <u>MODELO FLUKE 1550B DESCONTINUADO Y REEMPLAZADO POR EL MODELO 1550C</u>	\$18,323.00	\$36,646.00
15	2	432966	NO BID	-	-
16	1	979014	NO BID	-	-
17	1	1076558	NO BID	-	-
18	1	1076559	NO BID	-	-
19	2	950665	DIAGNOSTIC INSULATION TESTER 10 KV MODEL S1-1068, MEGGER PN 1003-010 <u>MODELO S1-1054/2 DESCONTINUADO Y REEMPLAZADO POR EL MODELO S1-1068</u>	\$18,592.00	\$37,184.00
20	1	927217	RECHARGEABLE BASIC KIT FOR EARTH SYSTEM TESTERS FOR FOUR POLE TESTING MODEL DET-4TCR2, MEGGER PN 1000-346 <u>MODELO DET-4TCR DESCONTINUADO Y REEMPLAZADO POR EL MODELO DET4-TCR2</u>	\$6,890.00	\$6,890.00
21	1	388085	COMPACT THERMAMCAM WITH WI-FI MODEL C5, FLIR PN 89401-0202 <u>MODELO FLIR PM595 DESCONTINUADO</u>	\$2,694.00	\$2,694.00
22	2	979021	NO BID	-	-
23	1	1050608	NO BID	-	-
24	1	902425	NO BID	-	-
25	2	677342	NO BID	-	-
26	2	913558	HIGH-TEMPERATURE INFRARED THERMOMETER MODEL 572-2, FLUKE PN FLUKE572-2 <u>MODELO FLUKE 574 DESCONTINUADO Y REEMPLAZADO POR EL MODELO 572-2</u>	\$3,496.00	\$6,992.00
27	1	386201	NO BID	-	-



INDUSTRIAL BUSINESS INTL CORP

1580 Sawgrass Corporate Parkway
Suite 130, Sunrise, FL 33323
Tel: 954-302-3187, 315-4781
Fax: 954-838-7746
E-mail: ibicorp@intech-ie.com

28	1	1136699	NO BID	-	-
29	1	524269	NO BID	-	-
30	10	1139513	NO BID	-	-
31	1	-	NO BID	-	-
32	2	-	NO BID	-	-
33	1	-	NO BID	-	-
			Delivery Time Item 1: 7-9 weeks after receipt of order and payment (subject to changes) Item 2-7,9-11,13,14,19-21,26: 3-6 weeks after receipt of order and payment (subject to changes) The delivery time of the items offered is subject to changes generated by events outside the company's control, such as: 1. Climatic phenomena that do not allow the transport of raw material to the factory, local transport abroad of the manufactured material and/or international transport of the product. 2. Normal functioning of Venezuelan and/or foreign customs. 3. Disruption of public order in the country of origin, country of transit and/or final country. 4. Criminal and/or terrorist acts. 5. Any other event considered major force. Payment terms Prepayment with PO Volume & Weight Weight / Volume to be advised		

PLEASE TRANSFER TO OUR ACCOUNT AT:

Branch Banking & Trust Co.
450 North Pine Island
Plantation, FL 33324
Account #: 0140953040
ABA# 053-101-121
Routing/Transit Number: 2631-9138-7
Swift Code: BRBTUS33

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS

Subtotal	US \$	1,897,047.00
Freight	US \$	Included
Insurance	US \$	Included
Docs.	US \$	Included
TOTAL	US \$	1,897,047.00