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Cotizacion 
 

Visit us at http://www.intech-ie.com 

 

Quote # C-2025-0287 

Date: 18/08/2025 

Customer ID CHEVRON PETROPIAR 

  

 
Bill to:  Ship to: 

CHEVRON GLOBAL TECHNOLOGY SERVICES 

COMPANY 
Av. Ppal La Estancia, Centro Banaven, Torre D, Piso 7, 

Chuao, Caracas 1060, Venezuela  

Att: Rafael Azuaje - Depto de Procura 
Rafael.Azuaje@chevron.com 

 

 CHEVRON PETROPIAR Warehouse 
Jose Complex, Edo Anzoategui, Venezuela 

 

Sales Rep. Your # Our # Destiny Terms Validity 
N. Carricatti VEN-RFQ-

PP-2025-107 
C-2025-0287/ Venezuela DDP Jose complex 30 days 

 

Item Cant Description Unit Price  

US$  

Total 

US$  

1 2 HOMOGENIZER DRIVE UNIT WITH DISPERSING TOOL, 30 mm FOR 500 TO 4000 mL 
VOLUME AND LABORATORY STAND FOR HOMOGENIZER, KAM CONTROLS 
PN 09014-09009-09018 
 
More information in the attached manual. 
 

$30.210,00  $60.420,00  

2 20 HYDRANAL™ - NEXTGEN Coulomat AG-FI, Anolyte for Coulometric Karl Fischer Titration, 
500 mL, Fluka™ 
PN BJ34433-500ML 
 
Anolyte for coulometric Karl Fischer titration, for cells with and without diaphragm, 
Methanol-based, free of Imidazole (free of CMR substances). 
 
Imidazole-free 
Assay of water: 5 - 50 ppm 
Methanol as solvent 
The suffix “FI”, added to the name of the reagent, indicates that the reagent is “free of 
imidazole”. 
 
Instead of imidazole, an alternative base has been used which does not compromise the 
performance of the Hydranal reagent. 
 

$780,00  $15.600,00  

3 4 NO BID 
 

$0,00  $0,00  

4 4 CENTRIFUGE MODEL 2-7, INCLUDING SWING OUT ROTOR (11071), BUCKETS (2x13299) & 
ADAPTERS (2x14300) FOR 15 mL CONICAL GRADUATED TUBES, SIGMA ZENTRIFUGEN 
PN 10226 
 
The Sigma 2-7 centrifuge meets the highest technical requirements and laboratory standards. 
Developed and produced at our facility in Osterode, Germany, it is a high-performance, 
durable and energy-efficient quality product and conforms to the latest safety, emissions and 
environmental standards. Sigma guarantees the availability of spare parts and wearing parts 
for at least 10 years. 
Furthermore, you benefit from our extensive services portfolio, including commissioning, 
maintenance, device calibration and more. Our qualified service technicians are ready to 

$13.990,00  $55.960,00  

INTECH Instrumentos y Equipos C.A. 

Av. Río Caura, Torre Humboldt, Ofic 04-04, 

Caracas, Venezuela 1080 
Tel:  58-212-9784430, 9784433, 977.7654, 977.6346 
Fax: 58-212-977.3613 
E-mail:sales@intech-ie.com 

RIF J-30615033-1 

mailto:Rafael.Azuaje@chevron.com


InTech                                    
Instrumentos y Equipos C.A 

INTECH INSTRUMENTOS Y EQUIPOS C.A. 
Av. Río Caura, Torre Humboldt, Ofic 04-04 

Caracas, Venezuela 1080 
Tel: +58-212-978.4430, 97844.33 

Fax:+58-212-977.3613 
E-mail: sales@intech-ie.com 

   
  

Page 2 / 9 

provide professional maintenance and repair as well as loaner devices if necessary. All support 
services are designed to ensure reliability and optimize system availability. 
 
Max. capacity [ml] 
Swing-out rotor 4 x 100 
Fixed-angle rotor 30 x 15 
Max. RCF 2,540 
Maximum speed [rpm] 4,000 
Minimum speed [rpm] 100 
Noise level at maximum speed (approximate) [dB(A)] 
Fixed-angle rotor 12073 54 
Swing-out rotor 11071 with buckets 13299 and caps 53 
Max. acceleration time [s] 
Fixed-angle rotor 12073 18 
Swing-out rotor 11071 with buckets 13299 and caps 13 
Max. braking time [s] 
Fixed-angle rotor 12073 14 
Swing-out rotor 11071 with buckets 13299 and caps 10 
Power consumption [W] 210 
Height x width x depth [mm] 293 x 378 x 535 
Height with open lid [mm] 643 
Weight without rotor [kg] 23 
 

5 1 OIML E2 Weight Set with Certificate, 500g-1mg, OHAUS 
PN 80780391 
 
OIML Class: E2 
Weight set with certificate 
500g - 1mg 
 

$14.210,00  $14.210,00  

6 1 Freestanding and Mobile Glassware Washers, VWR 
PN 10002-860 
 
Engineered for durable, reliable and energy efficient operation, these Glassware Washers 
can be either Freestanding or Mobile and are supplied with mounting feet and wheels. 
 
304 stainless steel washing chamber and full exterior casing ensures long life and corrosion 
protection plus maintains superior cosmetic appearance 
Three separate filters protect pumps from debris and are conveniently located for easy 
access 
Multiple cycle selections and microprocessor control systems ensure that each load is 
processed efficiently with minimum energy consumption 
Enhanced dual fan drying system 
Temperature selection to 70 °C (158 °F) for optimal cleaning of different loads 
Delayed start feature allows washer to operate unattended during off-peak hours to reduce 
energy cost 
Spindle Rack Ready models can accommodate 1 or 2 direct injection spindle racks 
Designed for simple operation and flexible loading, they can accommodate a wide range of 
requirements. New improved units feature a soft touch controller, improved drying, a 
quieter run, and are compatible with existing racks and accessories. Choose from three 
different models: Standard Freestanding and Mobile Washer, Freestanding and Mobile 
Washer with DI Rinse, or Freestanding and Mobile Washer with DI Rinse, Spindle Rack 
Ready. 
 
Certifications: ETL and ETL-C listed. 
Ordering information: A wide range of accessories are available to fit both upper and lower 
racks; spindle racks, specialty baskets, and other inserts. For more information, contact your 
Avantor representative. 

$37.440,00  $37.440,00  
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Delivery: All models come with top and bottom stainless steel open racks to accommodate a 
variety of glassware; spindle racks must be purchased separately. 
 
Electrical: 115 V, 60 Hz, 15 A 
Height: 97.8 cm (38.5") 
Depth: 55.0 cm (21.7") 
Width: 59.6 cm (23.5") 
 

7 4 NO BID 
 

$0,00  $0,00  

8 1 Water Bath PURA 22, JULABO 
PN 9550522 
 
Ease of use 
Bright display 
Splash-proof protected mains switch 
Built-in dry running protection 
No disturbing elements in the bath 
Platform included as standard 
Integrated timer 
Non-slip rubber feet 
Ergonomic recessed grips 
Integrated drain screw 
 
Bath 
Bath tank Stainless steel 
Bath cover accessory 
Usable bath opening in. (W x L / D) 21.7 x 10.6 / 7.1 
 
Other 
Classification Classification I (NFL) 
IP Code IP 21 
 
Electronics 
Temperature display LED 
Temperature setting Keypad 
Electronic Timer h:min 00:01 ... 99:59 
 
Waterbath 
Insert capacity for test tube racks 13 mm ø pc. 450  
Insert capacity for test tube racks 17 mm ø pc. 300 
Number of test tube racks pc. 5 
Dimensions with bath cover in. (W x L x H) 25.2 x 14.6 x 15.7 
 
Dimensions and volumes 
Usable immersion depth in. 7.1 
Weight lbs 25.4 
Dimensions in. (W × L × H) 25.2 x 13.8 x 10.2 
Filling volume l 3.4 ... 25.5 
 
Temperature values 
Setting the resolution of the temperature display °C 0.1 
Working temperature range °C 1 +18 ... +99.9 
Temperature stability °C 2 ±0.15 
Ambient temperature °C +5 ... +40 
Temperature display resolution °C 0.1 
 

$4.810,00  $4.810,00  

9 30 Hydrogen Sulfide H2S Tube, Model 4L, 10 – 120 ppm, GASTEC 
PN 4L 

$340,00  $10.200,00  
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Measuring range 10 to 120 ppm 

Number of pump strokes 1 （100 mL ） 

Correction factor 1 
Sampling time 45 sec 

Detecting limit : 0.2 ppm （10 pump strokes ） 
Colour change : White → Brown 
Operating conditions : 
Temperature 0 to 40 ℃ (32 to 104 ℉) correction not used 
Relative humidity 0 to 90 % correction not used 

Relative standard deviation: 5 % （for 10 to 120 ppm ） 

Tube quantity and number of tests per box : 10 tubes for 10 tests 
Shelf life: 36 months 
 

10 60 Hydrogen Sulfide H2S Tube, Model 4HH, 0.1 – 4 %p, GASTEC 
PN 4HH 
 
Measuring range 0.1 to 4 %p 

Number of pump strokes 1 （100 mL ）1/2 （50 mL ） 

Correction factor 1 / 2 
Sampling time 45 sec / 30 sec 

Detecting limit : 0.01 % （1 pump strokes ） 
Colour change : Pale blue → Blackish brown 
Operating conditions : 
Temperature 0 to 40 ℃ (32 to 104 ℉) correction not used 
Relative humidity 0 to 90 % correction not used 

Relative standard deviation: 10 % (for 0.1 to 0.6 % ）, 5 %（for 0.6 to 2 % ） 

Tube quantity and number of tests per box : 10 tubes for 10 tests 
Shelf life: 36 months 
 

$340,00  $20.400,00  

11 20 PYREX® Flat-Bottom Boiling Flasks, Long Neck, Corning, PYREX 
PN 4060-500 
 

 
(Imagen referencial) 

 

$130,00  $2.600,00  

12 4 NO BID 
 

$0,00  $0,00  

13 4 NO BID 
 

$0,00  $0,00  

14 2 NO BID 
 

$0,00  $0,00  

15 10 Graduated Cylinders, 500 mL, Class A, WARDS 
PN CH0341FBL 
 
Class A Cylinders. 
 
Blue graduations 
Hexagonal base 
Plastic cylinder guard 

$240,00  $2.400,00  
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These Class A Graduated Cylinders are the perfect laboratory companion. Made from high 
quality borosilicate glass with a hexagonal base. Supplied complete with protective cylinder 
guard. Cylinders comply with ASTM E1272 standard. 
 

16 2 KAM LKF Karl Fischer Laboratory Moisture Analyzer (Version 2.0), KAM CONTROLS 
PN 09150 
 
More information in the attached manual. 
 

$46.060,00  $92.120,00  

17 6 NO BID 
 

$0,00  $0,00  

18 2 NO BID 
 

$0,00  $0,00  

19 1 pH/REDOX/TEMP. Portable Measuring System, Lovibond 
PN 724230 
 
Display Large LCD display with contrast adjustment 
Auto – OFF Yes 
Power Supply DC 1,5 V battery (UM3,AA) 
DC 9 V adapter 
Portability Portable 
Protection Class IP 51 
Compliance CE 
Dimensions 120 x 40 x 220 mm 
Weight 625 g (unit incl. batteries) 
Weight with Packaging (unit incl. batteries) 
pH 0 - 14   
Redox -1999.9 - 1999.9 mV   
Temperature 0 - 60 °C 
 

$3.780,00  $3.780,00  

20 8 Digi-Sense ASTM Like Liquid-In-Glass Thermometer; 12C / Density-Wide Range, Total 
Immersion, -20 to 102C, Organic Liquid Fill, COLE-PARMER 
PN EW-08009-09 
 
Length (")17 19/64 
Min Temperature (° C)-20 
Max Temperature (° C)102 
Accuracy±0.6°C 
Division (° C)0.2 
Thermometer FillBlue Spirit 
Overall Length (InchShort)17.3 
Overall Length (mm)440 
Immersion Depth (mm)440 
Stem MaterialWhite-Back Glass 
ASTM Number12C 
DescriptionASTM Like Liquid-In-Glass Thermometer; 12C / Density-Wide Range, Total 
Immersion, -20 to 102C, Organic Liquid Fill 
 

$770,00  $6.160,00  

21 2 CORIO CP Heating/Cooling immersion circulator CP-BC12, JULABO 
PN 9013512 
 
Models for internal and external applications 
Bright, white, easy to read display 
Very quiet 
easy switching between internal and external circulation 
powerful and infinitely adjustable pressure pump 
USB connection 
RS232 interface for online communication 
High-quality bath tanks made of stainless steel with bath lid and drain tap 

$11.250,00  $22.500,00  
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115V/60Hz (Nema N5-15 Plug) 
Heating capacity kW 1 
Viscosity max. cSt 50 
Pump capacity flow pressure l/min 8 ... 27 
Pump capacity pressure bar 0.1 ... 0.7 
Power consumption A 10 
Bath 
Bath tank Stainless steel 
Bath cover integrated 
Usable bath opening cm (W x L / D) 22 x 15 / 20 
Electronics 
Interfaces RS232, USB 
Temperature control PID1 
Absolute temperature calibration 3 Point Calibration 
Temperature display LED 
Temperature setting Keypad 
Electronic Timer h:min 0 ... 999 
 
Dimensions and volumes 
Weight kg 12 
Barbed fittings inner diameter mm 8/12 mm 
Total dimensions cm (W × L × H) 33 x 49 x 47 
Filling volume l 8.5 ... 12 
Pump connections M16x1 male 
 
Temperature values 
Setting the resolution of the temperature display 
°C 
0.1 
Working temperature range °C +20 ... +200 
Temperature stability °C ±0.02 
Ambient temperature °C +5 ... +40 
Temperature display resolution °C 0.01 ... 0.1 

22 4 VWR® UHP Single Channel Pipettes and Pipette Sets, 10-100 uL, VWR 
PN 76627-792 
 
The VWR® UHP single channel pipette is available in sizes from 2 to 1000 µl with a 
lightweight and durable design. These pipettes will provide you with low pipetting forces 
and the highest levels of accuracy and precision. 
 
Autolocking volume mechanism to avoid volume drift while pipetting 
Fully autoclaveable and UV resistant 
Color coded ejector button and calibration switch make for easy identification 
Universal fit with most common brands of pipette tips 
Lightweight design, quality materials, low pipetting forces, and a 5-year warranty 
These single channel pipettes are calibrated to ISO 8655 standards using VWR® Universal 
pipette tips. Pipettes were tested for both autoclave and UV resistance. 
 
Certifications: In compliance with ISO 8655 
BodyTextAccessories: Pipette Stands are available in the accessories tab below. 
Packaging: Includes a QC certificate, pipette, quick reference guide, and calibration tool. 
 

$740,00  $2.960,00  

23 8 HYDROMETER ASTM 2H (9/21 API), KESSLER THERMOMETER CORP 
PN 7002 
 

$240,00  $1.920,00  

24 20 CENTRIFUGE TUBE - 100 mlL MARKED IN 1mL FROM 10-100 mL (CALIFORNIA STYLE), 
KESSLER THERMOMETER CORP 
PN 08-102 

$170,00  $3.400,00  
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25 20 NO BID 
 

$0,00  $0,00  

26 8 VWR® Traceable® Digital Barometer, VWR 
PN 10510-922 
 
500 - 1030 (mbar) 
Humidity Range: 5 to 95% RH 
Temperature Range: 32 to 131ºF and 0 to 55ºC 
 
Perfect unit for plants, labs, and all other environments where there is a need to monitor 
conditions of environmental air parameters. 
 
A four-line LCD continously and simultaneously shows barometric presure, temperature, 
relative humidity, barometric pressure trend and time. 
 
Computer output allows unit to be connected to a computer using the accessory Computer 
Data Acquisition System (sold separately) to permanently capture readings. 
 
Minimum/Maximum readings for barometric pressure, temperature and relative humidity 
are stored every hour for last 24 hours and are available for recall at the touch of a button. 
Barometric trend shows current reading, previous 1, 3, 6,12 hour and 24-hour readings in 
bar chart format; Adjustable altitude compensation from -100 to 2500 meters. 
 
Certifications: To assure accuracy, a Traceable® Certificate is provided from a ISO/IEC 17025 
calibration laboratory accredited by A2LA. It indicates traceability to standards provided by 
NIST. 
Ordering information: Supplied with batteries, wall mount, flip open stand, and a Traceable® 
Certificate. 
 

$1.260,00  $10.080,00  

27 2 DENSITY STANDARD ULTRA PURE WATER 5x10ml WITH WORKS CERTIFICATE, ANTON 
PAAR 
PN 96044 
 

$650,00  $1.300,00  

28 4 NO BID 
 

$0,00  $0,00  

29 180 CENTRIFUGE TUBE - 100 mlL MARKED IN 1mL FROM 10-100 mL (CALIFORNIA STYLE), 
KESSLER THERMOMETER CORP 
PN 08-102 
 

$170,00  $30.600,00  

30 240 NO BID 
 

$0,00  $0,00  

    
Delivery Time  
8 – 10 Weeks ARAD 

    Partial Shipments allowed 
 
Payment Terms 

• 100% Net 30 days delivery time 
 
 
Packing 

Material will be Securely packed in wooden crates suitable for air freight and export.  
 

 Volume & Weight (to be reconfirmed) 
 To be advised – Aprox 1700 Lbs 
 
General Warranty: 

warrants its products to be free from defects in material and/or workmanship for a period of 
eighteen (18) months following shipment or twelve (12) months following start up, whichever 
occurs first, provided that written claim be made during the period of the warranty. 
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Manufacturer’s obligation under this warranty is limited solely to repairing or replacing 
necessary parts and in no event shall Manufacturer’s be liable for damages in excess of the 
amount paid by the purchaser. 
 
 
 
Project Cancellation charges: 

15% 
 
Up to submittal of Engineering & Design Drawings and 
Documents 

25% 
 
After submittal of Engineering & Design Drawings and 
Documents 

50% 
 
After material order placement and before production 
commences 

75% 
 
Within two weeks of production release 

100% 
 
Two weeks after production commences 
 

 

  NOTAS: 
 

  

   
CONDICIONES DE PAGO 
 
COMPONENTE IMPORTADO 
 
En DOLARES AMERICANOS (US$) o en EUROS equivalentes mediante transferencia bancaria a 
la siguiente cuenta 
 
AMERANT BANK (in US$) 
220 ALHAMBRA CIRCLE, CORAL GABLES, FL. 33134 
CUENTA NUMERO 8303790106 
BENEFICIARIO INTECH INSTRUMENTOS Y EQUIPOS C.A. 
ABA 067010509 
SWIFT MNBMUS33 
 
 
COMPONENTE NACIONAL (IVA) 
 
En BOLIVARES (Bs.) mediante transferencia bancaria 
 
Banco Mercantil 
Cuenta Corriente a nombre de INTECH Instrumentos y Equipos C.A. 
 – 0105-0011-73-1011-50499-5 

 

  

   
OTRAS CONDICIONES 

 
1. Todos los Equipos suministrados por INTECH Instrumentos y Equipos son Nuevos y cuentan 

con Certificados de Conformidad del Fabricante en caso de ser requeridos 
 
2. El valor del IVA podrá ser pagado y/o retenido en moneda local (Bs.) a la tasa referencial 

del día en caso de que el mismo no pueda ser pagado en US$. El valor utilizado para el 
cálculo del mismo es tomado de acuerdo a lo informado por el Banco Central de Venezuela 
en su portal web www.bcv.org.ve y debera ser cancelado a la tasa oficial del día de pago o 
de la retención correspondiente 

 
3. Todos los materiales mantienen las condiciones de garantía Standard de los fabricantes. 

  
4. INTECH como representante y/o distribuidor exclusivo de múltiples marcas en el área de 

Instrumentación Industrial, calentamiento Eléctrico y Equipos de Laboratorio, solo 
suministrara garantía y servicio a los equipos y materiales adquiridos a través de los canales 
de venta autorizados de INTECH tanto localmente como internacionalmente 

 
5. Aporte SOCIAL: Esta Incluido en los precios y forma parte de la Oferta 

  

http://www.bcv.org.ve/
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6. Las empresas Mixtas no están sujetas a Impuesto a las Grandes Transacciones Financieras 

(IGTF), Por lo tanto, las facturas donde CHEVRON compra bienes o contrata servicios por 
cuenta de estas, no están sujetas a la percepción del IGTF. Todo ello con base en el Articulo 
9, Numeral 3 de la Ley del IGTF (Gaceta Oficial Nro 6.687 Extraordinario de fecha 25/02/22.  

 
Cci: W. Brito – INTECH PLCRZ 
 

 

 

 Subtotal       US$ 398,860.00 

 Freight         US$  Incluido 

 Insurance    US$ -- 

 IVA 16%      US$ 63,817.60 

 IGTF 3%     US$ --- 

 TOTAL        US$ 462,677.60 

 

Please Transfer to Account of:  
Bank: Amerant Bank 
Address: 220 Alhambra Circle, Coral Gables,  
              Florida 33134, USA 
ABA: 067010509 
Swift: MNBMUS33 
 
Beneficiary: INTECH INSTRUMENTOS Y EQUIPOS  
                  C.A. 
Account # 8303790106   

 


