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Cotizacion

Visit us at http://www.intech-ie.com

C-2026-0063
26/02/2026
CHEVRON PETROBOSCAN

Bill to:

Ship to:

COMPANY

Av. Ppal La Estancia, Centro Banaven, Torre D, Piso 7,
Chuao, Caracas 1060, Venezuela

Att: Rafael Azuaje - Depto de Procura
Rafael.Azuaje@chevron.com

CHEVRON GLOBAL TECHNOLOGY SERVICES CHEVRON PETROBOSCAN Warehouse
Edo Anzoategui, Venezuela

Sales Rep. Your # Our # Destiny Terms

Validity

N. Carricatti

PB-2025-251
PB-2026-255

VEN-RFQ- C-2024-0377Rev1/PL Venezuela DDP Jose complex

30 days

Item

Cant

Description

Unit Price
US$

Total
US$

24

CENTRIFUGE TUBE - 100 miL MARKED IN 1mL FROM 10-100 mL ASTM D-4007, KESSLER
THERMOMETER CORP
PN 08-102

$140,00

$3.360,00

HEATING MANTLE WITH CONTROLLER, 1000mL, 115V 50/60Hz ASTM D-4006,
ELECTROTHERMAL
PN EM1000/CEX1

1000ml Capacity

115V 50/60Hz, 300W Electrical Requirement

Chemically resistant polypropylene outer casing

Use with round bottom flasks from 50ml to 5 litres

Unique ventilation system which allows outer casing to remain safe to touch
Maximum element temperature 450°C

Built-in energy regulator

Model EM5000/CE has 2 circuits for upper and lower level heating
Replaceble insulated heater cartridge

Indicator lamps for power and heater operation

A chemically resistant polypropylene outer casing

A grounded earth screen and double fuses for extra safety

Supplied with bracket for 1.3cm diameter support rods (but not including support rod
rods)

$1.640,00

$3.280,00

12

DISTILLATION TRAP, 5SML IN 0.05 mL, CERTIFIED, KOEHLER
PN KD4006-A

$1.260,00

$15.120,00

12

DISTILLATION TRAP, 10ML IN 0.10 mL PYREX, CORNING
PN 09-146-5 (360210)

For water from petroleum or bitumens with volatile solvents

$930,00

$11.160,00
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This 10 mL PYREX™ Dean Stark distilling receiver is graduated from 0 to 1 mLin 0.1 mL
intervals, with a maximum scale error of 0.05 mL. The graduation intervals from 1.0 to
10.0 mL are 0.2 mL, with a maximum scale error of 0.1 mL.
5 10 | NOBID $0,00 $0,00
6 10 FLASK, 1000ML, S/T 24/40 ROUND BOTTOM, KOEHLER $240,00 $2.400,00
PN KD4006-F
7 1 MODEL CORIO CP-449F REFRIGERATED BATH WITH RECIRCULATION 20-26 L CAPACITY, $18.420,00 $18.420,00
TEMPERATURE RANGE -25 TO 200 C, 220V/60Hz INCLUDES 15 m HOSE, JULABO
PN 9013716.N1.33
Temperature Control Working Temperature Range -32 °C to +200 °C
Temperature Stability +0.03°C
Temperature Display LED (Resolution: 0.01 /0.1 °C)
Performance Heating Capacity 2 kW (2000 Watts)
Cooling Capacity (@ 20°C) 0.44 kW (using R290 refrigerant)
Pump Capacity (Flow) 8 to 27 L/min (infinitely variable)
Pump Capacity (Pressure) 0.1to 0.7 bar
Bath Details Bath Tank Material Stainless Steel
Bath Volume 21 to 30 Liters
Bath Opening (W x D) 280 x 350 mm
Bath Depth 200 mm
Physical Data Dimensions (W x L x H) 37 x59x 69 cm (14.6 x 23.2x 27.2 in)
Weight 39.5 kg (approx. 87.1 Ibs)
Refrigerant R290 (Natural/Eco-friendly)
Interfaces Digital Connections USB / RS232
Pump Connections M16x1 male (8/12 mm barbed fittings)
8 12 | NOBID $0,00 $0,00
9 1 MODEL EXP6202 ELECTRONIC BALANCE 6200 g CAPACITY, RESOLUTION 0.01 g WITH $8.740,00 $8.740,00
CERTIFICATE NIST, OHAUS
PN EXP6202-CERT
Max Capacity: 6,200 g (13.67 Ibs).
Readability: 0.01 g.
Stabilization Time: < 1 second.
Calibration: AutoCal™ (fully automatic internal calibration).
Pan Size: Trapezoidal, approximately 7.9" x 7" (201 mm x 178 mm).
Linearity: £ 0.02 g.
Includes NIST Certificate.
10 1 WEIGHT SET(16), 5 kg-1 g, ASTM 1, NVLAP CERTIFICATE, OHAUS $15.130,00 $15.130,00
PN 30391382
Calibration Certificate ISO/IEC 17025 Accredited Certificate
ASTM Class 1
Weight Set Range S5kg-1g
Set Capacity 10 kg
Set Total Pieces 16
Protective Case Included
Construction 1 g and above are two-piece; 500 mg and below are one-piece
Density at 20°C  Below 2 kg are 8.03 g/cm3; 2 kg and above are 7.95 g/cm3
Dimensions in Case 7.3inx15.2inx19.2in (18.542 cm x 38.608 cm x 48.768 cm)
(LxHxW)
Set Contents 10g; (2)20g; 100g; (2)2g; (2)200g; 1g; 50g; (2)2kg; 5g; 1kg;
500g; 5kg
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Weight Material >2 kg are 316 Stainless Steel; Below 2 kg are Troemner Alloy
Woegt Origin (USA) USA

11

NO BID

$0,00 $0,00

12

12

HYDROMETER ASTM 2H (CERTIFIED), KESSLER THERMOMETER CORP
PN 7002-C

$410,00 $4.920,00

13

12

THERMOMETER ASTM S12F-03 WITH SAFETYBLUE LIQUID (ASTM 12F, -5/215F), KESSLER
THERMOMETER CORP
PN 1040-SB

$130,00 $1.560,00

14

GRADUATED CYLINDERS, CLASS A, USP, CERTIFIED, FISHER SCIENTIFIC
PN 13-690-155

Certifications/Compliance
DIN EN ISO 4788, USP
Tolerance Metric
+3mL

Type

Graduated Cylinder
Calibration

To Contain

Scale Color

Blue

Capacity (Metric)
1000 mL
Graduations

10 mL

Height (Metric)

465 mm

Class

A

Shape

Round

Base Type

Hexagonal

Material

Borosilicate Glass
Includes

USP Batch Certificate
Subdivision

10mL

$710,00 $4.260,00

15

NO BID

$0,00 $0,00

16

Mylar Film 6pm, 3" x 300" Roll (12 UNITS PACK), KOEHLER
PN K47900-5

$5.850,00 $46.800,00

17

32 mm SAMPLE CUPS, DOUBLE OPEN ENDED W/ CAP (100PCS), KOEHLER
PN K47900-10

$5.260,00 $31.560,00

18

MODEL E-G52HS10C Digital Hotplate Stirrer, 10 x 10 inches CERAMIC, OHAUS
PN E-G52HS10C

Technical Specifications:

Function Stirring Hotplate

Top Plate Size 10 x 10 inches (26 x 26 cm)
Top Plate Material Ceramic

Housing Material Painted Aluminum

$2.260,00 $6.780,00
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Display 4.5 x 1.2 inch (115 x 30 mm) White Character LCD

Timer 1 minute to 99 hours 59 minutes

Temperature Range Ambient +5° to 360°C

Temperature Increments & Readability 0.5°C

Temperature Stability +1% Plate, below 100°C £1°C

+0.5% Probe, below 100°C +£0.5°C

Temperature Calibration (SPC) Set Points 3 points for Platice and 3 points for Probe

Probe Connection PT100, PT1000 (Class A)

Probe Temperature Measurement Accuracy  +:0.2°C + PT1000 (Class A) Tolerance

Heating Power 1650 Watts

Stirring Speed Range 50 to 1,800 rpm

Stirring Speed Stability 2%

Stirring Capacity (H20) 22 Liters

Data Logging & Remote Control built-in RS232, optional RS232-USB interface kit,

optional RS232-Ethernet interface kit

IP Rating 1P32

Dimensions (L x W x H) 15.84 x 11.28 x 4.65 inches (402 x 287 x 118 mm)

Working Environment 41°F — 104°F (5°C — 40°C), 80% RH non-condensing

Basic Model Net Weight  14.8 lbs (6.7 kg)

Electrical 100 - 120V, 8 A, 50/60 Hz
19 12 | NOBID $0,00 $0,00
20 10 CHEMGLASS LIFE SCIENCES 150ML BEAKER, LOW FORM, GRIFFIN, PYREX, FISHER $130,00 $1.300,00

SCIENTIFIC

PN 50-121-5002

150mL Beaker, Low Form, Griffin, Pyrex. Manufactured with uniform wall thickness these

beakers offer the optimum balance between thermal shock resistance and mechanical

strength. All sizes have an extra large marking spot. Designed from ASTM Specification

E960, Type | requirements.
21 1 NO BID $0,00 $0,00
22 1 PMA 500 FLASH POINT TESTER PENSKY-MARTENS ASTM D-93, ANTON PAAR $37.760,00 $37.760,00

PN 253527-253558

Basic Standards: Fully compliant with ASTM D93 (Procedures A, B, and C), ISO 2719, IP 34,

and JIS K2265-3.

Operating Range: Ambient temperature up to 410 °C.

Ignition System: Dual ignition system available; electric (long-life ceramic filament) or gas.

Spot Detection: Via fast-response thermocouple.

Safety: Fire detection sensor and automatic fire extinguisher (requires connection to inert

gas).

Pressure Correction: Integrated internal barometric sensor for automatic adjustment

according to atmospheric pressure.

Agitation: Adjustable speed from 0 to 300 rpm (according to ASTM D93 requirements).

Cooling: High-power fans that reduce the time between samples.

Display: 7-inch color capacitive touchscreen.

Storage: Internal memory for 50,000 results and 1,000 methods/users. Connectivity: 4

USB ports, 1 LAN (Ethernet) port for LIMS integration and PDF/Excel export.

Printhead: One-Hand quick-connect system (connects motor, sensors, and power supply

in a single movement).

Dimensions: 262 mm x 506 mm x 486 mm.

Weight: Approximately 15 kg.
23 10 | NOBID $0,00 $0,00
24 16 | NOBID $0,00 $0,00
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25 | 10 | NOBID $0,00 $0,00
26 10 | NOBID $0,00 $0,00
27 | 11 | NOBID $0,00 $0,00
28 24 | NOBID $0,00 $0,00
29 1 NO BID $0,00 $0,00

Delivery Time
ARAD/AROC,
Items: 8 — 12 weeks

Payment Terms
100% Payment 30 days DUE NET

Packing

Material will be Securely packed in wooden crates suitable for air freight and export.
Volume & Weight (to be reconfirmed)

To be advised — Aprox 948 Lbs

General Warranty:

Our brands warrants its products to be free from defects in material and/or

workmanship for a period of 18 months after delivery or 12 months from installation, whichever
occurs first, provided that written claim be made during the period of the warranty.
Manufacturer’s obligation under this warranty is limited solely to repairing or replacing
necessary parts and in no event shall manufacturer’s be liable for damages in excess of the
amount paid by the purchaser.

Project Cancellation charges:

15% Up to submittal of Engineering & Design Drawings and
Documents (when applicable)

25% After submittal of Engineering & Design Drawings and
Documents (when applicable)

50% After material order placement and before production
commences

0,

75% Within two weeks of production release

100% Two weeks after production commences

NOTAS:

CONDICIONES DE PAGO

COMPONENTE IMPORTADO

En DOLARES AMERICANOS (US$) o en EUROS equivalentes mediante transferencia bancaria a
la siguiente cuenta

AMERANT BANK (in US$)

220 ALHAMBRA CIRCLE, CORAL GABLES, L. 33134

CUENTA NUMERO 8303790106

BENEFICIARIO INTECH INSTRUMENTOS Y EQUIPOS C.A.
ABA 067010509

SWIFT MNBMUS33
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COMPONENTE NACIONAL (IVA)
En BOLIVARES (Bs.) mediante transferencia bancaria
Banco Mercantil

Cuenta Corriente a nombre de INTECH Instrumentos y Equipos C.A.
— 0105-0011-73-1011-50499-5

OTRAS CONDICIONES

1. Todos los Equipos suministrados por INTECH Instrumentos y Equipos son Nuevos y cuentan
con Certificados de Conformidad del Fabricante en caso de ser requeridos

2. El valor del IVA podré ser pagado y/o retenido en moneda local (Bs.) a la tasa referencial
del dia en caso de que el mismo no pueda ser pagado en US$. El valor utilizado para el
calculo del mismo es tomado de acuerdo a lo informado por el Banco Central de Venezuela
en su portal web www.bcv.org.ve y debera ser cancelado a la tasa oficial del dia de pago o
de la retencion correspondiente

3. Todos los materiales mantienen las condiciones de garantia Standard de los fabricantes.

4. INTECH como representante y/o distribuidor exclusivo de multiples marcas en el drea de
Instrumentacion Industrial, calentamiento Eléctrico y Equijpos de Laboratorio, solo
suministrara garantia y servicio a los equipos y materiales adquiridos a través de los canales
de venta autorizados de INTECH tanto localmente como internacionalmente

5. Aporte SOCIAL: Esta Incluido en los precios y forma parte de la Oferta

6. Las empresas Mixtas no estan sujetas a Impuesto a las Grandes Transacciones Financieras
(IGTF), Por lo tanto, las facturas donde CHEVRON compra bienes o contrata servicios por
cuenta de estas, no estan sujetas a la percepcion del IGTF. Todo ello con base en el Articulo
9, Numeral 3 de la Ley del IGTF (Gaceta Oficial Nro 6.687 Extraordinario de fecha 25/02/22.

7. En caso de requerirse algun Tipo de Fianza de Anticijpo, los Gastos de dicha Fianza seran
reembolsables (en la moneda de su contratacion) y por cuenta del Cliente CHEVRON, una
vez recibidos los materiales en su almacen.

In Tech
Instrumentos y Equipos, C.A. XA )

RIF: J-30615033-1 —y | =

NIT: 0096996004 N/

Please Transfer to Account of: Subtotal  US$ 212,550.00

Bank: Amerant Bank - _

Address: 220 Alhambra Circle, Coral Gables, Freight Us$ Incluido

Florida 33134, USA

ABA: 067010509 Insurance  US$ -

Swift: MNBMUS33 IVA16% USS 34,008.00

Beneficiary: INTECH INSTRUMENTOS Y EQUIPOS IGTF 3% USS$ ___

C.A.

Account # 8303790106 TOTAL USS$ 246.558.00

b L
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